December 19, 2007
Hawthorne, NJ

The Regular Meeting of the Municipal Council of the Borough
of Hawthorne was held on the above date at 8:00 p.m., in
the Auditorium of the Municipal Building, 445 Lafayette
Avenue, Hawthorne, New Jersey. Present were Councilpersons
Bennett, Bertollo, Goldberg, Sinning, and Matthews.
Councilpersons English and Wojtecki were absent. Also
present were Mayor Botbyl, Director of Revenue and Finance
Hewitt, Borough Attorney Pasquale, Borough Engineer Boswell
(arrived at 8:30 p.m.), and Borough Clerk Mele. Borough
Administrator Maurer was absent.

FLAG SALUTE

Council President Matthews invited all present to join him
in the flag salute.

STATEMENT

Council President Matthews stated adequate notice of this
meeting had been provided by the Annual Schedule of regular
meetings heretofore adopted and posted on the Public
Bulletin Board at the Municipal Building, mailed to the
Hawthorne Press, Gazette, Record and Herald & News, and all
such persons who have requested the mailing of such
schedule, and a copy of said schedule has remained on file
in the office of the Borough Clerk from and since December
21, 2006.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Council President Matthews entertained a motion to approve
the minutes of the Regular and Closed Session Meetings of
December 5, 2007, moved by Councilperson Bertollo, seconded
by Councilperson Bennett. On roll call all voted vyes.

PUBLIC COMMENT

Council President Matthews opened the meeting to the
public. He stated if anyone desired to be heard, please
raise your hand to be recognized, come forward to the
microphone and state your name and address. He stipulated
this was for agenda items only.
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1867 Sanitary Sewer Improvements 147,250.00

1870 2006 Road Program 142,500.00
1885 Improvements to Pool 61,750.00
1892/1907 Brookside Avenue 261,250.00
1905 2007 Road Program 237,500.00
1908 Renovation of Pool 237,018.00

Maturity Date: September 15, 2008
Written requests for bids were faxed on December 13, 2007, and bidding closed at 12
P.M., Wednesday, December 19, 2007.

Responses are as follows:

Bank of America No Bid

Chase Bank No Bid
Valley National No Bid
Atlantic Stewardship  No Bid
Commerce Bank 3.40

Notes were awarded to Commerce Bank at an intrest rate of 3.40

Council President Matthews entertained a motion to record
report NB-1, moved by Councilperson Goldberg, seconded by
Councilperson Sinning.

On roll call all voted yes.

ADMINISTRATIVE AGENDA

Mayor Botbyl administered the 0Oath of ©0ffice to Lisa
Szegedi who had been appointed to the Environmental
Commission at the last meeting.

Mayor Botbyl reported on behalf of the Borough
Administrator on the following:

The Hawthorne Fire Department has received a grant in the
amount of $4,250.00. The grant is for a program of DVD Fire
Prevention videos with a target audience of kindergarten
through the third grade. The grant is awarded by the
National Fire Safety Council as part of the FEMA and
National Homeland Security Departments.

Thanks were expressed to all Council Members for attending

the dedication of the Supportive Housing units that opened
on Mohawk Avenue this week.
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Ms. Hewitt stated she will keep Council apprised of the
current rate of collection. Currently the figure is 98.6.

The temporary budget is in the process of being prepared
for the January re-organization meeting.

Explanation of the transfers on tonight’s agenda were
given. It was stated these were discussed during the Work
Session.

Explanation on R-8, interfund items on tonight’s agenda was
given, stating that closeouts need to be done by years’
end.

A rate of 3.40 was received for the sale of the Bond
Anticipation Notes. The total amcunt from the sale will be
$3,605,000.00. The sale will take place tomorrow morning.

That concludes Director of Revenue and Finance Hewitt’s
report.

Mayor Botbyl asked CFO Hewitt to explain what BANS are for
the public’s knowledge.

CFO Hewitt provided an explanation on the Bond Anticipation
Notes.

Mayor Botbyl asked CFO Hewitt when she anticipates being
able to have the budget based on the current schedule
presented to Council?

CFO Hewitt explained the process and the number of items
needed to be received before moving forward. She explained
most of these are not received before mid-January, thus
making it the end of January before the budget could be
presented.

Mayor Botbyl stated at the Re-Organization Meeting on
January 1°° he will be presenting a 1listing of year end

accomplishments and some objectives for 2008.

Mayor Botbyl then called on Borough Attorney Pasquale for
his report.

Attorney Pasquale reported on the following:
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The traffic study for Goffle Road has been re-sent to the
County for review, as they claimed they didn’t receive the
first copy. We are awaiting their input.

A alternate striping plan for Goffle Road and Route 208 1is
being looked into.

The retaining wall at the softball field has been inspected
and found to be in very bad shape. It needs to be rebuilt.

Discussion continued.

Concerns on the wall of a building on Westervelt Avenue
have been addressed. It has been found to be in need of
the developer fixing the wall.

Concerns on the holes appearing in the roadway on Elberon
Avenue at the intersection of Lafayette Avenue have been
looked into. This will be included in the 2008 road
Program. It will be patched now and repaired next year.

That concludes Engineer Boswell’s report.

Council President Matthews asked 1f there were any
guestions for Administration.

Council President Matthews asked 1f a change to the
ordinance allowing snow removal violations to be paid by
mail or at the window be made a priority £for the 2008
Ordinance Committee.

Attorney Pasquale stated this change will be handled at the
beginning of January to allow pay at the window for snow
removal violations.

Council President Matthews asked if there was a esigned
agreement for the Kohler field vyet?

Attorney Pasquale stated there is no written agreement as
yet. The attorneys have gaid it is required by years’ end.
There are only one or two issues to be resolved.

Councilman Goldberg asked on the 98.6 collection rate, what
was budgeted foxr?

CFO Hewitt stated 98.6 was budgeted for, stating you always
budget about 2% less.
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CURRENT TO PAYROLL/FICA 51042 $ 10,321.85
WATER TO PAYROLL/FICA 14256 $ 3,000.00

TOTAL FICA $ 13,321.85
R-2. Resolution, Introduced by Councilman Bennett

WHEREAS, there appears on the tax record an overpayment for the 4™ quarter 2007
caused by a duplicate payment, and

WHEREAS, the taxpayers have requested a refund of the overpayment,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Collector of Taxes recommends that
the Treasurer be authorized by the Municipal Council of the Borough of Hawthorne to
issue a refund to the Taxpayers listed below:

Blk/Lot Name&Address Amount

87/1 Jerry Wlodarczyk & JFW Homes Inc. § 134.61
125 E. Prospect St.

165/16 635 Lafayette. LLC $2,769.00
635 Lafayette Ave.

233.01/2 Rafael & Karen Armstrong $1,447.36
23 Cathy Ave.

292/23 Joseph & Maria Zuccaro $2.978.16

17 Highview Terr.
$7,329.13

R-3. Resolution, Introduced by Councilman Bennett

WHEREAS: the tax record shows an added assessment payment for the 4™ quarter 2007
on Block 61 Lot 1 in the amount of $37.02, and

WHEREAS: the payment was applied to the wrong block and lot and a balance still
shows on Block 62 Lot 1,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: that the Tax Collector be authorized by
the Municipal Council of the Borough of Hawthorne to transfer the payment of $37.02

from Block 61 Lot 1 to Block 62 Lot 1.

R-4. Reszolution, Introduced by Councilman Bennett

WHEREAS: There appears on the tax record an overpayment due to a County Appeal
Judgment on Block 273 Lot 30, and
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AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Borough Clerk is hereby authorized and
directed to mail to any person so requesting a copy of this resolution and any
amendments thereto, and any advance written notice of any other meetings to be held
which are not set forth on the above schedule, provided, however, that such request is
accompanied by payment of a fee of fifteen ($15.00) dollars, which is hereby fixed as the
fee for mailing all such notices during the year, 2008. No fee shall be charged for
mailing all such notices to newspapers having circulation in Passaic or Bergen Counties
who may request the same.

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that if a person with disabilities requires aides
such as sign language interpreter, telecommunications, Braille, tapes or large print, the
Borough Clerk’s Office should be notified ten days prior to attendance at meeting so

accommodations may be made.

R-7. Resolution, Introduced by Councilman Bennett

WHEREAS, there exists a need for engineering services for plans and specifications to
retrofit the VAV Boxes in the Borough of Hawthorne.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Municipal Council of the Borough of
Hawthorne, that Boswell Engineering be awarded a contract in the amount not to exceed
$11,100.00 for the aforementioned purpose, and that the Mayor and Municipal Clerk be
directed and authorized to enter into and execute a contract, in a form approved by the
Borough Attorney subject to certification by the Chief Financial Officer.

R-8. Resolution, Introduced by Councilman Bennett

WHEREAS, 2007 Treasury records reflect certain interfund account balances as of
December 19, 2007 that require account transfers in order to liquidate same prior to the
close of the fiscal year.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Municipal Council of the Borough of
Hawthorne that the Treasurer be and is hereby authorized to settle these interfund items
as indicated herein:

PAY FROM PAY TO AMOUNT FOR
General Capital Current $ 546.73 2007 Interest
Assessment Trust Current $9,197.87 2007 Interest
of Asseessments
Payroll Current § 304.61 PY Interest
Payroll Current $10,832.40 PY Interfund

Regular Meeting  December 19, 2007 11
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WHEREAS, the application for such permit has been submitted to the Borough and
reviewed by the Borough Engineer and he has recommended approval:

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Municipal Council of the Borough of
Hawthorne that the Mayor and Clerk be authorized and empowered to endorse the
application on behalf of the Borough.

Council President Matthews entertained a motion to approve
Resolutions R-1 - R-9 & R-11 & R-12, moved by Councilperson
Bennett, seconded by Councilperson Bertollo.

Councilman Bennett thanked the Township of Wayne for their
efforts on this issue and Administration for adding R-11 to

tonight’s agenda.
Discussion continued.
On roll call all voted yes.

R-10. Regolution, Introduced by Councilman Sinning

WHEREAS, various appropriations in the 2007 Municipal Budget may be over-expended
and others under-expended.

~F

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Municipal Council of the Borough of
Hawthome that the Treasurer be and is hereby authorized to make the following
transfers:

FO FROM AMOUNT
Streets & Roads O/E Sewer O/E $ 10,000.00

Council President Matthews entertained a motion to approve
Resolutions R-10 as amended in the Work Session, moved by
Councilperson Sinning, seconded by Councilperson Bennett.

On roll call all voted yes.
REPORTS OF SPECIAL COUNCIL COMMITTEES:
Councilman Bertollo thanked Mayor Botbyl, Administration

and his fellow Council Members for another productive year.
He stated he 1is looking forward to the challenges of the

next four years.

Wishes for a Merry Christmas and a healthy and Happy New
Year were extended to all.
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Bill list

Date
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/15/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/18/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/18/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/15/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/19/07

Curren+

Vendor
635 LAFAYETTE AVE LLC
A-VAN ELECTRICAL
AAR EMERGENCY SUPPLY CO
ACORN TERMITE & PEST
ADVANCED AIR SYSTEMS
ALBERT J ERDMAN
ALEXANDER HAY
ANDREW E DENULLY
AQUARIUS IRRIGATION
ARCMATE MFG CORP
ASAP-MNJ
ATLANTIC DETROIT DIESEL
B & C COMMUMICATIONS,
BARCO PRODUCTS
BARRY HUSTON
BOB RAYOT TIRE SERVICE,
BOSWELL ENGINEERING, INC
BRAEN STONE INDUSTRIES,
CABLEVISION
CARL MOTTOLA
CARQI, CHAMBERLIN
CARPET CYCLE, LLC
CHARLENE ELVIN
CHIEF FIRE EQUIP CO
CHIEF SUPPLY CORP.
CINTAS CORP
CITY WIDE MAINTENANCE
DAVID WEBER OIL CO
DELL GARDEN CENTER
DON'S AUTO REPAIR
DOROTHY GEIER
FED EX
G.NEIL CO, INC
GET A CAN
GIANT TIRE SERVICE INC
GOLDEN RULE CREATIONS
GRAMCO BUSINESS COMMUN
GREENDISK, INC.
HAWTHORNE BOARD OF

Regular Meeting December 19, 2007

Check #

51043
51044
51045
51046
51047
51048
51049
51050
51051
51052
51053
51054
51055
51056
51057
51058
53059
51060
51061
51062
51063
51064
51065
51066
51067
51068
51065
51070
51071
51072
51073
51074
51075
51076
51077
51078
51079
51080
51081

Amount Appropriation
2769.00 TAX OVERPAY
819.13 PUB WORKS ADMIN O/E
193.19 FIRE DEPT O/E
90.00 PUB WORKS ADMIN O/E
1408.50 FIRE DEPT O/E
1375.00 GROUP INSURANCE O/E
114.00 PURLIC EVENTS O/E
315.98 TAX OVERPAY
153.34 RECYCLING PRO
148.20 CLEAN COMMUNITIES
295.00 MUNICIPAL ALLIANCE
3385.35 VEHICLE MAINT FIRE DEPT
648.00 POLICE DEPT O/E
168.16 PUB WORKS ADMIN O/E
779.99 BOARD OF REC O/E
180.00 RECYCLING PRO
2581.25 ENGINEERING SERVICES O/E
609.96 STREETS & ROADS O/E
477.95 PUB WORKS ADMIN O/E
42 .68 UNIFORM FIRE SAFETY O/E
100.00 GROUP INSURANCE O/E
250.00 RECYCLING PRO O/E
113.05 MUNTCIPAL ALLIANCE
180.25 POLICE DEPT O/E
351.93 LOCAL CODE ENFORCEMENT
300.95 PUB WORKS ADMIN O/E
1350.00 PUB WORKS ADMIN O/E
125.00 STREETS & ROADS O/E
1500.00 STREETS & ROADS O/E
768.50 VEHICLE MAINT POLICE
1490.82  DOMESTIC VIOLENCE
25.16 PEOSHA O/E
54.99 PEOSHA O/E
30400.00 RECYCLING PRO O/E
137.00 SCRAP TIRE GRANT A
2B87.09 LOCAL CODE ENFORCEMENT
6£9.00 PUB WORKS ADMIN O/E
459.95 RECYCLING PRO
2302500.00 SCHOOL TAX
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Daie VVendor
12/19/07 ¢ 1'S UNIFORM CO. INC
12/19/07 STATE LINE FIRE & SAFETY
12/19/07 TECHNICAL FIRE SERVICES,
12/19/07 VEOLIA ENVIROWMENTAL
12/19/07 VERIZON
12/19/07 VERIZON WIRELESS (N)
12/18/07 VITAL COMMUNICATIONS,
12/19/07 W. E. TIMMERMAN INC
12/19/07 WESTMARK INC
Total Bill List: 2478413.70
Bill list Water Operating Fund
Date Vendor
12/06/07 PAYROLL ACCOUNT
12/06/07 PAYROLL ACCOUNT
Total Bill List: 38975.07
Date Vendor
12/18/07 CABLEVISION
Total Bill List: 54.95
Date Vendor
12/19/07 A-VAN ELECTRICAL
12/19/07 ERAEN STONE INDUSTRIES,
12/19/07 CABLEVISION
12/19/07 DANIEL A SCHOPPERTH
12/19/07 DANIEL TEDESCHI
12/19/07 HAWTHORNE PAINT CO INC
12/19/07 Jpsc, INC
12/18/07 LEE CO
12/18/07 LUK OIL
12/19/07 MARY JEANNE HEWITT
12/19/07 MIRACLE CHEMICAL, INC
12/19/07 NIWA
12/19/07 ONE CALL SYSTEMS, INC.
12/19/07 USA BLUE BOOK INC
12/15/07 VERIZON
12/19/07 VERIZON WIRELESS (M)
Total Bill List: 5787.89

Regular Meeting

Check #
51124
51125
51126
51127
51128
51129
51130
51131
s 1122

Check #
14255

14256

Check #

14257

Check #
14258
14259
14260
14261
14262
14263
14264
14265
14266
142867
14268
14269
14270
14271
14272
14273

December 19, 2007

Amount

Appropriation

880.
3G,
600.
42632,
FF55
.77

1402

675.
2158.

00
30
0o
16
22

00
92

Amount

FIRE DEPT O/E
FIRE DEPT O/E
VEHICLE MAINT FI
TRANSFER STATIOK
TELEPHONE CHARGE
POLICE DEPT O/E
CONST CODE O/E
VEHICLE MAINT RC
TRT,EPHONE CHARGE

Appropriation

35975

1000

Amount

.07
.00

WATER UTILITY S,
SOCIAL SECURITY

Appropriatior

54.95

Amount

WATER UTILITY O

Appropriation

297.
703.
25,
20.
152.
145.
114.
360.
2075.
.44
530.
.00
.49
350,
1109.
291

43

375
118

17

70
B8O
90
00
B6
50
20
00
03

70

82

41
04

WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
WATER UTILITY O,
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Council President Matthews entertained a motion to approve
the bills, and refer them to the Treasurer for payment,
moved by Councilperson Goldberg, seconded by Councilperson
Bertollo.

Council President Matthews asked 1f there were any
guestions?

On roll call all voted vyes.
PUBLIC COMMENT:

Council President Matthews opened the meeting to the
public. If anyone desires to be heard, please raise your
hand to be recognized, come forward to the microphone and
state your name and address.

Bob Kurdock, 202 May Street, asked if the Borough is paying
for the County equipment sitting in the park.

Engineer Boswell stated no, the Borough is not paying daily
for the equipment.

Mr. Kurdock gquestioned why the Brockhuizen Lane easement
can’'t be resolved.

Attorney Pasquale stated less then half the residents of
Brockhuizen Lane have written easements in their deeds. He
clarified the easements do not stipulate who is responsible
for maintenance of the property.

Discussion continued.

Mr. Kurdock expressed concern over residents clearing their
property in snowstorms and placing the snow in the
roadways.

Council clarified that it is illegal for residents to place
snow into the roadways.

Mr. Kurdock wished all a Happy Holiday. He congratulated

Mayor Botbyl on his plans for performance evaluations and
stated he is looking forward to his report on the outcome.
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